
JOHNSON COUNTY, MISSOURI

TAX SALE SUMMARY

AUGUST 26, 2019

TS TAX, INT CLAIMED

CERT NO PROPERTY OWNER offer & FEES BID SURPLUS SURPLUS BIDDER NOTES

019-001 BEDFORD, JONATHON D  300.15 300.15 0.00  FURAUS, DUANE  

019-002 CAMPBELL, MATILDA & B F COOPER 492.67 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2020 sale

019-003 CULBERTSON, DONALD & RANDY 473.38 473.38 0.00  FURAUS, DUANE  

019-004 DAVIDSON, BERNICE LEE 2,848.84 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2020 sale

019-005 SCHWARTZ, JEFFERY D 1,686.39 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2020 sale

019-006 HOMESTEAD HEARTLAND LLC  1,109.71 1,109.71 0.00 VALOR CHURCH

019-007 MOORE, DEBORAH L 874.79 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2020 sale

019-008 STUCKER, RICHARD L 406.15 406.15 0.00 McCORMACK, WILLIAM S

019-009 THOMAS, J R & B C 190.27 190.27 0.00 FURAUS, DUANE  

019-010* WALLACE, WILLIAM R 343.97 450.00* 0.00 SKINNER, MARY JANE* Carried over to 2020 sale

019-011 ORR, LOUIS 2ND 1,192.74 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2020 sale

019-012 WATSON INVESTMENTS GROUP INC 2ND 2,270.74 0.00 0.00 NO BID Carried over to 2020 sale

   

*Bidder Mary Jane Skinner failed to pay bid of $450 on Cert No 019-010.

Also owed 2018 PP tax and, therefore, filed false affidavit.  RSMo 140.190 & 140.280

requires payment of 25% penalty as a result.  Received $112.50 from Skinner.


